
5 soveværelse Landsted til salg i Albox, Almería

Casa Pocicas – This wonderful 5 bedroom, 3 bathroom cortijo has been tastefully renovated and brought up to
modern living standards. There is a 10m x 5m swimming pool with spectacular views, separate guest accommodation
comprising of 1 bedroom, 1 bathroom, lounge and kitchen. There is plenty of parking for several cars and a
motorhome. The property sits in 3,220 sqm gardens and has an overall build size of 240sqm.

The property is situated in Las Pocicas just 10-15 minutes outside the main market town of Albox with all your daily
amenities including supermarkets, banks, schools, medical centre, shops, sports facilities, bars, restaurants and cafes.
The coastal resorts of Mojacar, Vera Playa and Garrucha are 30-40 minute drive. Almeria and Murcia airports can be
reached in 1 hour 30 minutes.

The property is accessed via a sliding gate with a huge terrace and to the right there are 2 caves currently used for
storage and there is parking for several cars and a motorhome. There is also access from the street behind the
property with a double gate into the backyard.

There is separate guest accommodation that could be an extra income, for visiting family or friends. This has a pretty
terrace in front. Next to this is a garden with various fruit trees. There is a good size open plan lounge/kitchen, double
bedroom, large bathroom with shower, WC and wash basin.

To the front of the property is a large tiled terrace with flowers and shrubs around and a lovely seating area to soak
up the surrounding beauty. Entering through the front door into the lounge with pellet burner. To the right there is a
bedroom. A hall from the lounge leads to another bedroom currently set up as an office and the master bedroom with
air conditioning and a dressing area that could be a further bedroom. There is a large bathroom with twin sinks,
corner Jacuzzi bath, corner shower, WC and bidet. The kitchen is accessed via the lounge and has ample work tops and
cupboards. Next to the kitchen is a second bathroom and a sitting room/snug or could be an extra bedroom with
wood burner. There is a large patio/courtyard outside and a storage area housing the washing machine and gas
boiler. The property has radiators fitted for central heating but no boiler connected to it but one can be easily fitted.
The patio leads to the garden behind the property which is gravelled for easy maintenance with mature shrubs and
flowers. There are many storage areas within the garden. The swimming pool has plenty of space for sun bathing and
taking in the wonderful views. Next to the pool is the pool house and terrace where there is an outside kitchen/bar
area that would benefit from a few extra additions to make it fully functional.

From the backyard and through the terrace in front of the house there is access to a vacant lot where you can make
another terrace or a garden. The views are wonderful from both the garden and the house.

  5 soveværelser   3 badeværelser   240m² Byg størrelse
  3.220m² Grundstørrelse   Privat pool

199.000€
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